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Belmont Park çAthenia-G3

1Â MILES (Inner Turf). (1:39¦) THE ATHENIA. Grade III. Purse $100,000 For Fillies And Mares Three
Years Old And Upward. No nomination fee. A supplemental nomination fee of $1,000 may be made at time of entry;
$500 to pass the entry box and an additional $500 to start. All starters including supplements will be required to pay
all fees. The purse to be divided 60% to the winner, 20% to second, 10% to third, 5% to fourth, 3% to fifth and 2%
divided equally among remaining finishers. Three year olds, 120 lbs. Older 123 lbs. Turf weights: Non-winners of a
graded sweepstake on the turf in 2010 allowed 3 lbs.; a sweepstake on the turf in 2010 or a graded sweepstake on
the turf in 2009, 5 lbs.; four races on the turf, 7lbs. Dirt weights: Non-winners of a graded sweepstake on the dirt in
2009-10 allowed 3 lbs.; a sweepstake on the dirt in 2010 or four races on the dirt, 5 lbs. Inthe event that this race is
taken off the turf, dirt weights will apply and it may be subject to downgrading upon review by the Graded Stakes
Committee. Closed Saturday, October 2, 2010 with 31 Nominations and 1 Supplement.

Giant Mover
Own: Evans Edward P
Yellow, Black Diamond Hoop, Black

COHEN D (74 13 5 6 .18) 2010: (920 160 .17)

Ch. f. 4 (Feb)
Sire: Giant's Causeway (Storm Cat) $100,000
Dam:Gold Mover (Gold Fever)
Br: Edward P Evans (Va)
Tr: Pletcher Todd A(46 9 8 5 .20) 2010:(876 230 .26)

L 120

Life 15 4 2 1 $157,313 91

2010 4 1 2 0 $66,800 91

2009 10 3 0 1 $89,223 80

Belê 1 1 0 0 $26,400 78

D.Fst 2 0 0 0 $2,640 56

Wet(397) 2 0 0 0 $3,440 60
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(349) 11 4 2 1 $151,233 91
Dstê(363) 5 1 1 1 $47,783 89

11æ10=10Mth fm 1Â ê 1:40¦ 3ÎçRevidere76k 89 7 1¨ô 1§ô 1§ô 1¦ 2¦ Decarlo C P L123 3.00 92= 10 EyeofTurus117¦ GintMovr123¬ö TlkinAboutLov117ö Dug in gamely inside 8
1Ý10= 9Mth fm 1° ê :48©1:12© 1:36¦1:47© 3ÎçMatchmkr-G3 86 11 2¦ 1¦ 1¦ô 1Ç 5¦ô Dominguez R A L116 10.70 88= 12 Unbridled Essence118ô Quiet Meadow116Ç Tottie116ö Inside,yielded 11
26Þ10= 8Cnl fm 1 Ñ :24 :48 1:12 1:35¨ 3ÎçÐBrookmeade50k 90 2 1§ 1§ô 1¨ 1¤ 1¬õ Karamanos H A L122 *.50 97= 13 Giant Mover122¬õ Huge118¨ Patriot Miss117Ç Rail, pace, driving 5
23Ü10= 9Mth fm 1 ê :23¨ :47¦ 1:10§1:34§ 3ÎçOC 62k/N3X -N 91 2 1¦ô 1¦ô 1Ç 1¦ô 2Ç Velazquez J R L120 5.10 90= 11 Mystic Miracle120Ç Giant Mover120ÉMiss Blakely122§õ Pace, just failed 7
Previously trained by McLaughlin Kiaran P 2009(as of 11/18): ( 539 108 85 83 0.20 )
18ä09= 8Aqu gd 1Â ê :25© :52¦ 1:17 1:46§ çFlitalong69k 64 6 4§ 3¦ 3¦ 7¦¥ 7¦¥ô Castro E L118 24.25 64= 20 West Ocean118É Denomination120¦ Akilina122ö Steadied break, 3wide 8
23å09= 8Med gd 1Â ê :24¦ :49§ 1:13 1:43© 3ÎçOC 32k/N2X -N 75 3 5¨õ 3¦ 3ô 2Ç 1ö Castro E L116 2.50 82= 19 Giant Mover116ö Shadow Lane116Ç P Js Lil Toni119¦ Bid 3 wide, driving 9
7æ09= 8Mth fm 1° ê :48©1:12¨ 1:36 1:47¨ çTwinLights65k 72 6 5§õ 3§ 4¨ 7¬ö 7¬õ Velez J A Jr L117 3.60 83= 11 Redreamit117§ö Unbridled Essence117ÉMissBlakely121ô 3 wide trip, tired 7
16Ý09= 7Mth fm 1° ê :45§1:09§ 1:34 1:46¨ 3ÎçAlw 41000N1X 80 6 3ªô 4«ô 4§ô 1Ç 1¦ Castro E L116 5.30 95= 06 GintMover116¦ SentimentlUnion120¦õ OnDmnd120ó 3wd bid,edged clear 10
16Û09= 8Mth fm 1Â ê :23¦ :47 1:10¨1:40¦Õ3ÎçAlw 44280N1X 75 6 2ô 2¦ 2¦ 3ô 3©õ Castro E L119 4.40 89= 07 MysticMiracle115¨õ RojosTune120¦ GiantMover119ô Bid turn, outfinished 6
Previously trained by Jerkens James A 2009(as of 5/24): ( 80 14 19 10 0.18 )
24Ü09= 7Bel fm 1° Ñ :49 1:12© 1:36§1:48¨ 3ÎçMd SpWt 44k 78 3 1§ 1¦ 1ô 1§ 1ó Castellano J J L118 10.10 90= 10 GiantMover118ó GolddOro118¦õ Dnceyoursocksoff118¦õ Dug in, prevailed 9
19ß09= 4Aqu fm 1Â ê :24§ :50§ 1:15©1:45© 3ÎçMd SpWt 44k 72 7 2¦ 2ô 2¦ 2¦ô 4§ Castellano J J L118 2.45e 76= 18 RedyFormycloseup118¦ HlfSurprise118ö UpprGulch123É Pressed winner 9
22à09= 2Aqu fst 1¬¥ Ö :23© :47¨ 1:13¦1:43¦ 3ÎçMd SpWt 44k 56 4 4¨ 4© 4¨ô 5¤ô 5¦¦ô Russell Sª L113 23.60 69= 16 Solo Piano123©ö Trini Dubai116¨ Black Orchid116¦ Steadied being rated 7
WORKS: å10Mth 4f fst :49 B 21/76 å3Mth 4f fst :51¨ B 129/142 æ26Mth 4f fst :51 B 54/71 æ5Mth 4f fst :51¦ B 51/64 Ý29Mth 4f fst :50 B 55/91 Ý16Mth 4f fst :51§ B 16/22
TRAINER: 31-60Days(740 .24 $1.79) Turf(629 .19 $1.78) Routes(1181 .22 $1.82) GrdStk(341 .19 $1.66) J/T 2009-10 BEL(19 .37 $2.75) J/T 2009-10(132 .33 $2.26)

Mary's Follies
Own: Pompa Jr Paul P
White, Green Circle, Red 'P,' Red

DESORMEAUX K J (9 0 3 1 .00) 2010: (526 89 .17)

B. f. 4 (May) KEESEP07 $40,000
Sire: More Than Ready (Southern Halo) $30,000
Dam:Catch the Queen (Miswaki)
Br: Mr & Mrs David Randal (Ky)
Tr: Dutrow Richard E Jr(33 5 11 8 .15) 2010:(468 110 .24)

L 120

Life 9 4 3 1 $317,889 93

2009 8 4 3 0 $313,809 93

2008 1 M 0 1 $4,080 59

Belê 0 0 0 0 $0 -

D.Fst 5 1 2 1 $56,780 86

Wet(354) 2 1 1 0 $54,600 86
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(328) 2 2 0 0 $206,509 93
Dstê(349) 2 2 0 0 $206,509 93

14ä09= 9CD fm 1Â ê :24¦ :48§ 1:12§1:41¨ çMrsRvere-G2 93 5 3§ 5¦ö 5¦õ 1¦ 1¦ô Desormeaux K J L117 9.40 95= 08 Mary's Follies117¦ô Keertana119¦ Romacaca117É Split horses, cleared 14
3å09=10Pha fst 1Â :22© :45¨ 1:09¦1:41§ çFDCtlln-G2 79 6 3¨ 4¨ 5¨ 6¤ô 6¦¥ô Elliott S L122 14.30 88= 10 Careless Jewel124¨ô Bon Jovi Girl114¦õ Key LimeBaby115ö Wide, faltered 6
31Û09= 8Sar sly 1° ï :47§1:11© 1:36©1:50¨ çLkGeorge-G3 86 2 2¦ô 2¨ 2¦ 2¦ 2© Dominguez R A L118 *1.05 76= 22 Be Fair116© Mary's Follies118®ö The Best DayEver116ö Brief lead, yielded 4
Previously trained by Forbes John H 2009(as of 6/27): ( 5 3 1 0 0.60 )
27Þ09= 9Mth gd 1Â ê :23§ :46¨ 1:10¨1:41¦ ÕçBlngSpg-G3 90 1 3¦ 4§ô 4§ 3É 1ô Elliott S L116 6.70 88= 16 MarysFollies116ô KiawahCt116¦õ Obsequious116§õ Back to rail,prevailed 8
11Þ09= 5Mth gd 1Â :23© :47© 1:12©1:44 3ÎçAlw 41000N1X 84 3 3¨ô 3¨ 3ô 1§ô 1§ö Marquez C H Jr L116 *.30 86= 13 MarysFollies116§ö DrivenbyPassion115ªö OnDemand120ªô Off inside, clear 7
16Ü09= 9Mth fst 6f :21¨ :44¦ :56§1:09§ çJustSmshng65k 86 1 6 6ª 5¨ô 3§ 2É Marquez C H Jr L117 12.50 90= 11 OntheMenu117ÉMrysFollis117É BoldUnion121¨ô Broke slow,game finish 6
Previously trained by McBurney Patrick B 2009(as of 4/7): ( 37 7 2 6 0.19 )
7ß09= 9Pha fst 6ôf :22¦ :46 1:11 1:17¨ çAlw 51140N1X 72 5 5 5¨ 2¦ô 2§ 2É Mello D L121 7.00 87= 20 PuddydeLuca121ÉMarysFollies121¨ BeholdLdy116¬ô Angled in, game try 7
17à09= 7Pha fst 6f :22 :45¦ :58 1:11 çMd SpWt 43k 67 4 5 6¨ö 5§ô 3¦ 1¦õ Mello D L121 4.50 84= 15 Mary's Follies121¦õ Dark Eyes121ô Bright Star116ó Ran down leaders 10
25æ08= 5Mth fst 5ôf :22§ :45¨ :58 1:04¨ çMd 75000(75-65) 59 5 4 3§ô 3ô 3§ 3ªõ Fragoso P L120 7.20 81= 21 Exe120§ö Power Express118§ôMary's Follies120©ô Bid 3 wide, weakened 7
WORKS: å8Aqu 6f fst 1:14 B 3/6 å2Aqu 6f gd 1:15¨ B 4/5 æ25Aqu 5f fst 1:02© B 5/6 æ20Aqu 3f fst :37§ B 1/2 æ14Aqu 6f my 1:15© B 3/3 æ7Sar tr.t 5f fst 1:03© B 6/7
TRAINER: +180Days(78 .14 $0.90)WonLastStart(216 .30 $1.74) Turf(245 .20 $1.37) Routes(443 .22 $1.47) GrdStk(99 .20 $1.87) J/T 2009-10 BEL(3 .67 $2.80) J/T 2009-10(11 .36 $3.69)

Trix in the City
Own: Symons Patsy C
Bright Pink, Bright Lime Green Sleeves

HILL C (62 1 0 12 .02) 2010: (642 68 .11)

Ch. f. 4 (Mar) OBSAPR08 $300,000
Sire: Friends Lake (A.P. Indy)
Dam:Trix City (Carson City)
Br: Roasting Ear Ranch LLC (Ky)
Tr: Violette Richard A Jr(21 1 2 6 .05) 2010:(202 33 .16)

L 116

Life 12 3 3 0 $89,098 90

2010 2 1 0 0 $37,100 90

2009 7 2 2 0 $41,328 89

Belê 0 0 0 0 $0 -

D.Fst 7 2 2 0 $42,128 86

Wet(426) 2 0 1 0 $10,700 89
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(192) 3 1 0 0 $36,270 90
Dstê(361) 1 0 0 0 $170 58

16Ý10= 1Sar gd 1 Ñ :24¦ :48§ 1:12§1:35¨ 3ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 90 5 1ô 1¦ 1¦ô 1§ 1¦ Dominguez R A L120 b 17.50 90= 16 Trix in the City120¦ Paracaidas120¦ Go Ask Alex112¨ö Ins, asked 1/4, clear 7
9Û10= 3Mth fst 1 :23¨ :47 1:11§1:38¦ 3ÎçAlw 78300N2X 80 3 5§õ 5§ô 3¨ô 3§ 4§õ Gomez G K L120 b 7.10 78= 30 Clssofsixtythr120É VrySwt117¦ö DbonrDrlng120É 4wd 3/16,needed more 7
Previously trained by Rice Linda 2009(as of 10/13): ( 321 77 42 42 0.24 )
13å09= 7Med fst 6f :23§ :45© :57©1:10¦ 3ÎçOC 32k/N2X -N 66 7 6 5§ö 5ª 4¬ô 4«õ Bravo J L117 b *.70 81= 15 UncornGrl119¦õîLvnFstfrwrd112îEmlyAllstr123ª 4 wide, no response 7
29Ý09= 7Sar sly 6f :21© :44© :56©1:09¨ çVctryRde-G3 89 1 7 6ªô 6ªõ 6¨ô 5ªö Dominguez R A L116 b 13.50 89= 09 Sara Louise120§ Bold Union120ô Juliet's Spirit120¦ö Saved grd, no bid 9
9Ý09= 4Sar fst 6f :22 :44§ :56§1:08© çËGeyserSpr72k 81 4 3 6¬ô 7¤ 5ªô 4¬ö Garcia Alan L118 b 13.10 91= 07 Elusive Heat118ªõ Simplify118É Northern Belle118§õ Swung wide no bid 7
26Þ09= 7Mth fst 6f :22 :44¨ :56¨1:09§ 3ÎçOC 32k/N2X -N 86 1 6 4¨ô 4§ 2¦ô 2ó Bravo J L115 b 3.10 90= 17 FncyDimond120ó TrixintheCity115¦ô SkyHven115¦ô Rail bid, just missed 6
25ß09= 7Tam fst 6ôf :22¨ :45¨ 1:10¦1:17 çOC 50k/N1X -N 75 4 5 4¨ 2Ç 1Ç 1¦ô Cruz C L122 b 3.60 96= 12 TrixintheCity122¦ô SwtYulinn114É PrissyProxy118ô Long drive, edged clr 6
11ß09= 9Tam fst 6ôf :22§ :45© 1:11¦1:18¦ çMd SpWt 17k 68 8 2 4¨ô 1ô 1§ô 1¦ö Cruz C L120 b *1.80 90= 16 Trix intheCity120¦ö PremierRoma120®ô OmegaCat120¦ö Drew off, prevailed 9
7à09= 9Tam fst 6ôf :22© :46¨ 1:11¦1:17¨ çMd SpWt 20k 57 6 2 3¦ 2ô 2¨ô 2ªö Cruz C L120 b 2.50 87= 13 SwtYulinn120ªö TrixinthCity120¦¥ô ShllBRight120§ No match, second best 9
27ã08= 4Tam fm Í1Â ê :24¨ :51¦ 1:17¦1:49 çMd SpWt 17k 58 4 9¨õ 9«ô 7©ö 7§õ 5© Velez J A Jr L120 b *1.00 73= 23 Abuela120¦öWhisperer120¦õMi Helena120Ç Angled out, outkicked 10
13æ08= 3Mth gd 1¬¥ :23¦ :46¨ 1:12¦1:42¨ çMd SpWt 37k 64 5 3§ô 2¦ô 2Ç 2ô 2¦õ Dominguez R A L119 b *1.40 79= 16 CoffinBd119¦õ TrixinthCity119§õ Itwllblovly119®ö Bid btwn,no match late 6
29Ý08= 4Sar fm 5ôf ê :21¨ :44¦ :56 1:02¦ çMd SpWt 62k 66 2 2 4§ô 4¨ 3© 4©õ Garcia Alan L118 b *2.30 90= 04 KysndJys118É JustLivinDrem118§ StrikingDncr118§ Rail move, flattened 9
WORKS: å8Aqu 1 fst 1:47¨ B 2/2 æ26Aqu 4f fst :49¦ B 11/24 æ16Aqu 4f fst :50¨ B 8/19 æ10Aqu 5f fst 1:02 B 5/14 Ý30Sar 4f fst :49 B 10/39 Ý8Sar 5f fst 1:02 B 23/31
TRAINER: 61-180Days(59 .17 $2.19)WonLastStart(68 .19 $2.72) Turf(124 .15 $2.59) Routes(191 .14 $1.95) GrdStk(17 .06 $1.75) J/T 2009-10 BEL(1 .00 $0.00) J/T 2009-10(1 .00 $0.00)
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Miss Catalyst
Own: Twin Creeks Racing Stables Saufley Ge
Lime Green, Brown Diamond, Lime And

LUZZI M J (38 4 2 3 .11) 2010: (415 45 .11)

Ch. f. 4 (Mar)
Sire: Mr. Greeley (Gone West) $50,000
Dam:Key to the Cat (Tale of the Cat)
Br: Gulf Coast Farms LLC (Ky)
Tr: Pletcher Todd A(46 9 8 5 .20) 2010:(876 230 .26)

L 116

Life 10 3 3 1 $162,690 94

2010 1 0 0 0 $350 73

2009 7 3 3 0 $154,500 94

Belê 4 2 0 1 $99,750 93

D.Fst 0 0 0 0 $0 -

Wet(370) 1 0 0 0 $2,640 60
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(307) 9 3 3 1 $160,050 94
Dstê(337) 2 0 2 0 $13,650 82

4Ý10= 8Sar gd 1 Ñ :23© :47¦ 1:11¦1:34© 4ÎçËDeLaRose70k 73 8 5¨ô 5¨ 5¦ô 8©ö 9¦¥õ Velazquez J R L116 6.10 84= 08 Miss Keller116¦ Keertana118¨ Dreamt116¨ 3 wide both turns 9
12å09= 8Bel fm 1 ê :23¦ :47¦ 1:10©1:34 çPebbles110k 93 9 4¦ô 3ô 3É 1¦ô 1É Castellano J J L117 7.70 90= 15 Miss Catalyst117É Pull Dancer119óMaram121¦ 3wide fully extended 9
3æ09= 8Sar fm 1 Ñ :23§ :47¦ 1:12¦1:34 çRiskaverse72k 94 1 3¦ô 3¨ 3¦ô 2§ 2¨õ Castellano J J L117 4.90 97= 07 SilverReunion117¨õMissCtlyst117ª AftrnoonStroll122§ Rail trip, 2nd best 10
2Ý09= 1Sar gd 1 Ñ :24© :48 1:12¨1:37 3ÎçAlw 53000N1X 89 4 6¬ 3§ô 3¦ 1ô 1É Castellano J J L119 7.70 85= 24 Miss Catalyst119É Dynaslew119¦ Strike the Bell118¦ Fully extended 8
1Û09= 2Bel gd 1 ê :23§ :47¦ 1:11©1:36 3ÎçMd SpWt 44k 87 6 4§ 4§ô 3ô 1§ 1¦ Castellano J J L118 5.00 80= 19 Miss Catalyst118¦ Siren Serenade118§Minishaft118¦ Fully extended 9
17Ü09= 5Bel fm 7f ê :23¦ :47© 1:11§1:23¦ 3ÎçMd SpWt 43k 80 10 3 4¨ 3¦ô 6© 4ªö Velazquez J R L118 *1.25 78= 15 Strike theBell118ö Minishaft118¨ WestCourt118§ Pressed outside weaken 10
15ß09= 3GP fm 1Â ê :23© :48 1:11¨1:41¨ çMd SpWt 35k 82 7 1ô 1¦ô 1ô 1§ 2ô Decarlo C P L121 *.90 81= 18 Rena121ô Miss Catalyst121¦ö Powder Burn121¨ö Pace,outfinished 11
11â09= 5GP fm 1Â ê :23© :48§ 1:12§1:42¨ çMd SpWt 40k 78 7 2Ç 1Ç 1¦ô 2Ç 2¦õ Decarlo C P L121 5.90 76= 21 AskbtIWnttll121¦õ MssCtlyst121§õ PrdsBnd121¨õ Bumped st, outfinished 12
26ä08= 2Aqu gd 1 ï :23¦ :46§ 1:12¨1:40¨ çMd SpWt 52k 60 3 3ô 2¦ 3¦ô 4¨ 4ªõ Velazquez J R L120 *1.85 54= 41 AlwysWilling120¦ö ElenisHope120¨ RideWiththHrd120ô Hard used for 6F 10
19å08= 5Bel fm 7f ê :22 :45 1:09¨1:22 çMd SpWt 52k 74 7 10 9¬ 9¤ 6ª 3¦ô Prado E S L119 14.00 88= 07 Just Livin a Dream119¦ Nan119ô Miss Catalyst119¦ Wide, good late rally 12
WORKS: å10Sar tr.t 4f fst :50¨ B 19/37 æ27Sar tr.tê5f fm 1:00© H(d) 2/9 æ20Sar tr.tê5f fm 1:01¦ H(d) 2/8 æ13Sar tr.tê5f fm 1:03 B(d) 6/12 æ6Sar tr.tê5f fm 1:00§ B 2/16 Ý30Sar tr.tê4f fm :47¨ H 5/29
TRAINER: 61-180Days(207 .25 $1.64) Turf(629 .19 $1.78) Routes(1181 .22 $1.82) GrdStk(341 .19 $1.66) J/T 2009-10 BEL(3 .00 $0.00) J/T 2009-10(23 .26 $1.60)

Tottie (GB)
Own: Julien H Richmond-Watson
Green, White Belmont Emblem And Cap

LEZCANO J (111 12 23 17 .11) 2010: (845 137 .16)

B. f. 4 (Apr)
Sire: Fantastic Light (Rahy)
Dam:Katy Nowaitee*GB (Komaite)
Br: Lawn Stud (GB)
Tr: Brown Chad C(21 3 4 5 .14) 2010:(234 51 .22)

L 123

Life 16 5 0 2 $225,834 89

2010 6 4 0 1 $206,550 89

2009 6 0 0 1 $11,507 -

Belê 1 1 0 0 $34,200 88

D.Fst 0 0 0 0 $0 -

Wet(259*) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Synth 1 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(339) 15 5 0 2 $225,834 89
Dstê(272) 4 2 0 0 $57,021 88

21Ý10=10Mth fm 1´ ê :50 1:15¨ 1:40 2:15 3ÎçOmnibus96k 89 4 5¨ô 5¨ 4¨ 3§ô 1É Garcia Alan L123 1.50 79= 14 Tottie123É Speak Easy Gal123¦ô Tarrip117ó Good late response 8
1Ý10= 9Mth fm 1° ê :48©1:12© 1:36¦1:47© 3ÎçMatchmkr-G3 88 10 8«ô 8«ö 8¨ö 7¨ô 3ô Lezcano J L116 4.70 88= 12 UnbridledEssence118ô QuietMedow116Ç Tottie116ö 3wd into lane,rallied 11
17Þ10= 3Bel fm 1Â Ñ :25© :50© 1:15¦1:43¨ 3ÎçOC 75k/N3X -N 88 1 4© 4§ 3¦ 1ô 1§ö Lezcano J L120 *1.40 80= 18 Tottie120§ö Miss World120¦ö Kristi With a K120«ö 3wide going away 4
9ß10= 7Kee fm 1Â ê :23¨ :47¨ 1:12§1:42¦ 4ÎçAlw 61668N3X 80 12 12¤õ12¤ö 12¤õ 9«õ 9¨ô Lezcano J L118 *2.00 90= 01 Elision118¦ Denomination118Ç Forest Trail118ô Hard to load, hopped 12
6á10=11GP fm 1° ê :50©1:15§ 1:38©1:50¦ 4ÎçSwneRvr-G3 87 9 2§ 2¨ 2¦ 2ô 1ö Lezcano J L118 *1.80 71= 20 Tottie118ö Cable118É In My Glory118Ç All out, prevailed 9
7â10= 7GP fm 1Â ê :23© :46© 1:10§1:41 4ÎçAlw 37000N1X 88 8 9¦¥10¦¥ 9«õ 5¦õ 1¦õ Lezcano J L120 *2.60 91= 17 Tottie120¦õ Speak Easy Gal120¦ Salsa Star120Ç 4 wd, edged away late 10
Previously trained by Amanda Perrett

6Ý09 Sandown Park (GB) gs 1²ê RH 2:11© Apres-Ski Christmas Party Nights Hcp 6¬ Crowley J 133 b 3.50 Amazing Blue Sky118ó Sequillo126É Almuktahem128§ô 7
Racing Post Rating: 78 Hcp 20400 Rated in 4th,weakened over 1f out
29Û09 Goodwood (GB) gd 1°ê RH 1:56¦ 3Î çCountry Life Magazine EBF Hcp 4É Crowley J 134 b 7.50 Alsace Lorraine139É Full of Love127ó Club Tahiti131ó 14
Racing Post Rating: 93 Hcp 32900 3rd on rail,led 3f out,couldn't last
25Û09 York (GB) gd 1³ê LH 2:10© 3Î çSkybet.com EBF Handicap (1 1/4m,88y) 5« Callan N 128 6.00 Summer Gold129Ç Spouk127§ Antigua Sunrise118¦ô 11
Racing Post Rating: 84 Hcp 24700 Unruly gate,soon 6th,always one-paced
25Þ09 Newcastle (GB) gf 1²ê LH 2:11§ 3Î çEBF Hoppings Stakes (1 1/4m,32y)(Listed) 5¤ô Crowley J 119 7.50 Lady Jane Digby131ª Syvilla131¦ô Medici Pearl131ó 8
Racing Post Rating: 86 Stk 65700 Missed break,no factor.GripsholmCastle4th.QueenMartha6th
5Þ09 Epsom (GB) gd 1¶ê LH 2:35¦ çEnglish Oaks-G1 8§© Crowley J 126 66.00 Sariska126ÇMidday126§ô High Heeled126©ô 10
Racing Post Rating: 83 Stk 566500 Missed break,trailed,weakened over 2f out.Rainbow View 4th
9Ü09 Lingfield (GB) gf 1Ãê LH 2:30§ çLingfield Oaks Trial (Listed) 3«ö Crowley J 124 7.00 Midday124« July Jasmine124ö Tottie124É 9
Racing Post Rating: 92 Stk 76200 Rated in 5th,distant 2nd 2f out,lost 2nd late
WORKS: òå10BelÑ5f gd 1:02 B(d) 1/6 å3Bel tr.t 4f fst :50© B 106/154 æ26Bel tr.t 4f fst :49© B 16/38 æ20Bel tr.t 4f fst :50 B 15/22 æ14Bel tr.t 4f fst :50 B 17/27 æ6Bel 4f fst :49¦ B 5/27
TRAINER: 31-60Days(154 .25 $1.52)WonLastStart(83 .31 $2.17) Turf(275 .21 $1.77) Routes(300 .20 $1.50) GrdStk(32 .22 $2.22) J/T 2009-10 BEL(50 .26 $2.17) J/T 2009-10(175 .24 $1.84)

Exquisite (NZ)
Own: Winner Charles A Bienstock David Mand
Black And Gold Halves, Black "Winner"

ESPINOZA J L (56 1 6 8 .02) 2010: (456 39 .09)

B. m. 6 (Sep)
Sire: Golan*Ire (Spectrum*Ire)
Dam:Elyzabel*NZ (Kaapstad*NZ)
Br: Windsor Park Stud Ltd (NZ)
Tr: Terranova John P II(24 2 3 4 .08) 2010:(165 33 .20)

L 118

Life 26 4 5 2 $150,124 92

2010 6 0 3 0 $37,317 92

2009 4 1 1 0 $39,400 91

Belê 0 0 0 0 $0 -

D.Fst 0 0 0 0 $0 -

Wet(336*) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Synth 1 0 0 0 $400 66
Turf(246) 25 4 5 2 $149,724 92
Dstê(204) 1 0 0 1 $7,200 79

Previously trained by Gallagher Patrick 2010(as of 7/3): ( 123 10 21 18 0.08 )
3Û10= 4Hol fm 1 ê :23© :48 1:11¨1:34© 3ÎçRlHrinMl-G2 83 6 5© 5¨ 6¨ô 6¨ö 6©ô Espinoza V LB117 12.20 83= 15 GottaHaveHer121ô BurgBerg117¦ URAllThtIAm117¦ 4wd into str,no rally 6
5Þ10= 4Hol fm 1 ê :25¨ :50¦ 1:14¦1:36§ 3ÎçËRedondoBch61k 81 3 5ª 5¨ 4¦ô 4§ô 4ö Espinoza V LB119 2.50 79= 12 TurningTop119Ç RoseydeMegev119É VluStrm119ô Pulled early,willingly 5
1Ü10= 9Hol fm 1 ê :24 :47¦ 1:10¨1:34¦ 3ÎçWilshirH-G3 89 3 7ªô 8©ö 8¨ö 6©õ 7¨ô Espinoza V LB115 10.10 88= 09 MedglidAmour114¦õ CtbythTl118ó YouLiftMUp116Ç Pulled,btwn,no bid 10
4ß10= 7SA fm 1 ê :23§ :46§ 1:10 1:34¨ 4ÎçAlw 56800C 91 6 5ª 5«ô 5© 4¦ö 2ô Espinoza V LB116 1.90 87= 12 WellMonied116ô Exquisite116ó ChsinDrems116ö Came out 1/8,led,edged 7
3à10= 7SA fm 1 ê :23 :46¨ 1:11¦1:35© 4ÎçAlw 68080C 92 7 9¦¦ 6¤õ 5©õ 5¨ 2ô Espinoza V LB117 *2.70 81= 18 YouLiftMeUp123ô Exquisite117É ShesCheky117ó Steadied 3wd into lane 10
8â10= 7SA fm 1 ê :23¨ :47¨ 1:11§1:35¦ 4ÎçOC 100k/C -N 90 5 7© 7©ô 7¨ö 7§õ 2ö Espinoza V LB118 8.50 84= 15 GeneralConsensus118ö Exquisite118É Eissoi116Ç 4wd into str,btwn late 9
6ä09= 9OSA fm 1 ê :23 :47¦ 1:10§1:33§ 3ÎçLsPlmasH-G2 81 14 9¤ô 9¬ 9«õ 9¤ô 9ª Solis A LB116 28.90 92= 07 TuscnEvening118¦õ Closeout116ó CtbytheTle118¦ô Off bit slow,3wd lane 14
1å09= 7OSA fm 1 ê :23§ :47¦ 1:10§1:34 3ÎçOC 62k/N2X -N 91 5 6ªô 6ª 6ª 5§ö 1¦ Solis A LB120 6.70 94= 07 Exquisite120¦ Bel Air Sizzle120¦ April Pride116ö Came out str,rallied 8
22à09= 8SA gd 1° ê :48¦1:12¨ 1:36©1:48¨ 4ÎçSntaAnaH-G2 61 4 2ô 2ô 2¦ 7¬õ 7¦¦ö Solis A LB116 13.50 73= 15 Belmont Cat115Ç Bel Air Sizzle115É Visit118Ç Bpd brk,forced, faded 7
30â09= 2SA fm 1 ê :23¦ :47 1:10©1:34¨ 4ÎçAlw 56000N2X 90 3 1¦ô 1¦ 1¦ 1ô 2ó Solis A LB119 7.70 91= 09 Solar Miss119ó Exquisite119ó Sugar Mint119©ô Rail, nodded at wire 5
26ä08= 7Hol fst 1Â ú :23¨ :47¦ 1:11§1:43¨ 3ÎçAlw 43800N2X 66 5 3¨ 3¦ 5¨ö 7«õ 7¦¥õ Solis A LB122 4.40 74= 20 ForestMelody120¨õ WinendDyn120¦ö DoublDip120ô 3wd 2nd turn,wkened 7
3å08= 7OSA fm 1° ê :48©1:12¨ 1:35©1:47¨ 3ÎçAlw 50200N1X 86 3 2¦ 1Ç 1¦ 1Ç 1É Solis A LB124 3.30 90= 07 Exquisite124É Fire n' Brimstone118ô Mohaka118¦ Pulled,held btwn foes 8
WORKS: å3Pha 5f fst 1:01§ B 9/34 òÝ29Dmrê5f fm 1:01¦ H(d) 1/5 Ý22Dmrê4f fm :48§ H(d) 2/4 Ý12Dmrê4f fm :49© H(d) 3/4
TRAINER: 1stW/Trn(33 .24 $2.60) 61-180Days(62 .18 $1.25) Turf(110 .14 $1.60) Routes(152 .13 $1.36) GrdStk(35 .11 $1.10) J/T 2009-10 BEL(3 .00 $0.00) J/T 2009-10(3 .00 $0.00)

Eye of Taurus
Own: Clarke Harvey A
Gray, Emerald Green Cross Sashes, Green

CASTRO E (11 3 1 3 .27) 2010: (847 100 .12)

B. f. 4 (Mar) KEESEP07 $170,000
Sire: Aldebaran (Mr. Prospector)
Dam:Ocean Shore (Silver Hawk)
Br: T Wayne Sweezey & Patrick Lawley-Wakelin (Ky)
Tr: McLaughlin Kiaran P(32 6 5 1 .19) 2010:(367 91 .25)

L 120

Life 18 5 3 3 $249,630 94

2010 5 1 0 2 $68,200 93

2009 10 4 2 1 $168,360 94

Belê 0 0 0 0 $0 -

D.Fst 6 1 1 0 $32,930 70

Wet(325) 2 0 1 1 $12,820 73
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(291) 10 4 1 2 $203,880 94
Dstê(326) 4 2 0 1 $134,000 94

11æ10=10Mth fm 1Â ê 1:40¦ 3ÎçRevidere76k 91 2 5©ö 4¨ô 2§ô 2¦ 1¦ Castro E L117 2.40 93= 10 EyeofTurus117¦ GintMover123¬ö TlkinAboutLove117ö Came out, willingly 8
1Ý10= 9Mth fm 1° ê :48©1:12© 1:36¦1:47© 3ÎçMatchmkr-G3 83 2 5©ô 6©ö 5§ô 6§ô 7§ö Castro E L116 7.80 86= 12 UnbridledEssence118ô QuitMdow116Ç Totti116ö Lacked needed response 11
4Û10=10Mth fm 1Â ê :24¨ :48¦ 1:12 1:41§Õ3ÎçMsLiberty97k 93 4 3¦ô 3§ 6¦ö 2¦ô 3ô Castro E L117 7.50 86= 14 Maram117Ç Strike the Bell119ô Eye of Taurus117ô Inside trip, willingly 9
31Ü10=10Mth fm 1Â ê :24© 1:12©1:41¨Õ3ÎçEatntwnH-G3 87 1 1¦ 1ô 1ô 2Ç 5§ô Garcia Alan L116 1.80 83= 10 Gypsy's Warning117óMaram116¦ö Scolara118ô Set pace, weakened 5
11ß10= 8Kee fm 1 ê :24¨ :49¨ 1:14 1:36§ 4ÎçAlw 65000C 90 6 2§ 2¦ô 1Ç 2Ç 3§ Garcia Alan L118 5.70 88= 10 Keertana118É Fantasia118¦ö Eye of Taurus118§ Led briefly, gave in 8
23å09= 9Kee yl 1Â ê :24 :49 1:15§1:46§ çVllyView-G3 94 7 2¦ô 3§ 2ô 1Ç 1Ç Velazquez J R L117 13.40 71= 30 Eye of Taurus117ÇMiss Keller117¨õ Keertana123¦õ Bid 3 w, stiff drive 11
Run in divisions
18æ09= 8Mth gd 1 ê :23 :46§ 1:10§1:35¦ 3ÎçAlw 42000N2X 86 4 5©õ 5©ô 3¦ô 1Ç 1§ô Castro E L117 3.30 86= 19 Eye of Taurus117§ô Honorable Truth120É Ravenous117ô Split foes, rallied 10
8Ý09= 5Mth fm 1 ê :23§ :47¦ 1:10¨1:34¦ 3ÎçAlw 42000N2X 81 9 4§ 4¨ 4§ 5§õ 4¦ Morales P L118 9.20 90= 07 QuietHrbor122ö StelinKisss120É ItsNotforLov122ó 4wd into lane,gaining 11
23Û09= 8Mth slyø 1Â ï :24 :48¦ 1:12¨1:44¨ 3ÎçAlw 40740N2X 63 1 2Ç 2Ç 2§ 3«ô 3¦¥ Castro E L117 1.80 73= 17 Roxyana115§ö ReatasVixen122¬õ EyeofTaurus117¦ô Vied inside, weakened 4
27Þ09= 7Mth gd 1 ê :23© :48 1:12 1:35© 3ÎçAlw 42804N1X 79 3 4¦ô 4¦ô 3¦ 1Ç 1¦ Castro E L115 2.00 83= 16 Eye ofTaurus115¦ DwellingPlace115ö Rojo'sTune120ô Broke out,bid btwn 8
3Þ09= 6Mth gd 1Â ï :24 :47© 1:12§1:43© 3ÎçAlw 41000N1X 73 5 2¦ 2¦ô 2ô 1Ç 2¦õ Morales P L115 *1.40 86= 16 ReatsVixen120¦õ EyeofTurus115§ DebonirDrling117¦¥ö Stalked, bid, gamely 6
10ß09= 1Aqu yl 1 ê :24 :48§ 1:14¦1:39¨ 3ÎçAlw 46000N1X 78 4 3¨ 3© 3§ô 2¨ô 2¨ö Morales P L115 21.00 81= 29 StormyReltions120¨ö EyeofTurus115¨ôMcVictory115¬ö Rail trip, 2nd best 7
WORKS: å10Mth 4f fst :48§ H 8/76 å3Mth 4f fst :48¨ B 22/142 æ3Mth 4f fst :49¨ B 17/34 Ý28Mth 4f fst :50§ B 47/72 Û24Mth 4f fst :49§ B 19/50 Û18Mth 4f fst :49© B 37/77
TRAINER: 31-60Days(375 .27 $1.92)WonLastStart(203 .22 $1.66) Turf(308 .20 $1.87) Routes(502 .23 $1.73) GrdStk(126 .17 $1.75) J/T 2009-10 BEL(7 .14 $0.86) J/T 2009-10(105 .21 $1.53)
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Darjeeling
Own: Turtle Bird Stable
Powder Blue, White Diamond, White

VELASQUEZ C (95 14 13 18 .15) 2010: (846 113 .13)

B. m. 6 (Apr)
Sire: Cat Thief (Storm Cat) $5,000
Dam:Boldly Extravagant (Bold Ruckus)
Br: Amarpreet Bhangoo & Overbrook Farm (Ky)
Tr: Asmussen Steven M(23 5 5 0 .22) 2010:(1984 423 .21)

L 116

Life 15 4 2 2 $171,075 86

2010 3 1 2 0 $62,800 86

2009 3 1 0 1 $20,980 82

Belê 2 2 0 0 $45,000 86

D.Fst 9 2 0 2 $88,397 78

Wet(384) 2 0 0 0 $4,878 75
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(295) 4 2 2 0 $77,800 86
Dstê(344) 0 0 0 0 $0 -

16æ10= 4Bel fm 1 ê :23¦ :45¨ 1:09¨1:33¨ 3ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 86 1 2¦ 2§ 2ô 1Ç 1¦ Garcia Alan L120 b 4.10 93= 12 Drjeeling120¦ InPerpetuity116¦ö WhiskdAwy120É Taken hold, urged 3/16 8
21Ý10= 4Mth fm 5f ê :21 :43¦ :55 3ÎçOC 40k/N2X -N 84 3 9 7§ô 6©ö 6©õ 2ô Garcia Alan L120 b *2.30 97= 02 Suzzona124ô Darjeeling120¦ö Twiceasbeautiful120§ô Good finish outside 11
18Û10=10Mth fm Í5ôf ê 1:02¨ 3ÎçAlw 76800N2X 82 3 4 4§ 4§ 3¦ô 2ó Garcia Alan L120 b 3.70 91= 09 Out Post120ó Darjeeling120¦ô Forever Grateful120¦ö Game finish outside 6
24ä09= 7Med fst 1¬¥ ï :23§ :47§ 1:11©1:42 3ÎçOC 32k/N2X -N 62 5 1ô 1ô 1Ç 2¦ 3¨ö Garcia Alan L119 b 2.50 77= 16 YippetyYip123¨ Wonderwhosbest114ö Drjeeling119¨ Set pace, weakened 6
2å09= 1Bel gd 6f Ñ :22 :45§ :57¦1:09¦ 3ÎçClm 25000B 82 7 9 6ª 5§ô 1¦ô 1© Garcia Alan L120 b 8.20 89= 14 Darjeeling120© Token Special120ö Risky Gamble117Ç 6wide drew off 10
19Þ09= 3Bel gd 6f :23 :45¨ :57¦1:09§ 3ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 47 1 5 3§ 3¨ 6® 6¦«ö Dominguez R A L120 b 5.10 76= 14 HoldThtProspct120¨ OcnGoddss120¦ö BmofLov123§õ Bobbled break, faded 6
Previously trained by Toner James J 2008(as of 5/4): ( 22 3 2 3 0.14 )

4Ü08= 7Bel fst 6ôf :22 :44© 1:09§1:15© 3ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 72 5 6 5©ô 5©ö 3© 3ªô Garcia Alan L121 b 11.90 89= 11 AreWeDreamin123Ç ThundersDove121ªô Drjeeling121¨ô 4 wide into lane 7
7ã07= 8Aqu fst 6f Ö :22 :45¦ :57¦1:10 çRaiseHeck77k 20 5 2 4¨ô 6® 6¦¤ 6§¬õ Garcia Alan L118 b 15.20 67= 09 Frisk Her118ó Your Flame in Me123§ö Golden Dawn118©ô 3 wide trip, tired 6
10ä07= 7Aqu gd 6f :21© :45¦ :57§1:10¨ çLadyTak78k 75 1 4 5¦¥ 4« 5¬ö 4«ô Espinoza J L L118 b 10.50 82= 12 YourFlmeinMe118©ô FriskHer118§ HlfTimCrown118ó Bumped after start 7
7å07= 4Bel fst 6f :22¨ :45¨ :57©1:11 3ÎçOC 75k/N1X -N 78 2 1 1¦ô 1¦ô 1¨ 1¦ö Garcia Alan L120 b 3.30 83= 16 Darjeeling120¦ö SacredChrm118§ ComeFlyAwy120§õ Soon clear, kept busy 7
29Ý07= 9Sar fst 6f :21© :44¨ :57¦1:11 3ÎçMd SpWt 62k 76 10 1 2¦ 2Ç 1ô 1ªö Garcia Alan L118 b 15.80 85= 09 Darjeeling118ªö Perfectly Natural118¦ô Etro118ö Bumped start, clear 11
Previously trained by Miceli Michael 2007(as of 4/18): ( 60 6 13 8 0.10 )
18ß07= 4Aqu fst 6ôf :23¦ :46§ 1:11¦1:17© çMd SpWt 43k 18 6 3 6¦õ 7® 7¦¬ 7§¥õ Hill C L120 8.80 68= 12 Sweetsinginanita120É Partida120ó Social Queen120¨õ Had no rally 8
WORKS: å10Bel tr.t 4f fst :49¨ B 21/59 å3Bel 5f fst 1:02¨ B 35/47 æ26Bel 4f fst :53 B 69/69 æ7Bel tr.t 5f fst 1:03¨ B 2/2 Ý31Bel 4f fst :51 B 35/39 Ý16Bel tr.t 4f fst :49 B 13/38
TRAINER: WonLastStart(956 .24 $1.53) Turf(690 .16 $1.26) Routes(1590 .21 $1.54) GrdStk(173 .16 $1.59) J/T 2009-10 BEL(20 .30 $3.26) J/T 2009-10(26 .35 $3.55)

Missit (Ire)
Own: Three Chimneys Racing
Green, Two Yellow Hoops, White Sleeves

MARAGH R (108 19 14 12 .18) 2010: (1105 132 .12)

B. m. 5 (Jan)
Sire: Orpen (Lure)
Dam:High Spot*GB (Shirley Heights*GB)
Br: Churchtown House Stud (Ire)
Tr: Attfield Roger L(2 1 0 1 .50) 2010:(229 49 .21)

L 116

Life 21 4 7 0 $312,950 92

2010 6 1 2 0 $72,650 89

2009 5 1 2 0 $59,200 92

Belê 0 0 0 0 $0 -

D.Fst 0 0 0 0 $0 -

Wet(285*) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(313) 21 4 7 0 $312,950 92
Dstê(296) 3 0 1 0 $13,587 89

25æ10= 7WO fm 1 ê :23© :46§ 1:09©1:34¦ 3ÎçOC 80k/N3X -N 86 6 4§ 3§ô 3¦ô 2ô 1É Jones J L122 5.00 89= 15 Missit122É Sugar Again118§ô Sheraton Park122ö Rallied proved best 9
13Ý10= 4WO fm 7f ê :23 :45¦ 1:08©1:21 3ÎçOC 80k/N3X -N 84 6 2 4«ô 3¤ 3¦ 2ö Jones J L122 9.40 92= 08 Sugar Bay122öMissit122ô Lemon Twirl122É Rallied good try 6
14Û10= 4WO fm 1Â ê :24 :47§ 1:11¨1:40© 3ÎçOC 80k/N3X -N 77 8 7© 7« 6¨õ 4¨ 8«õ Da Silva E R L122 5.80 84= 10 Impossible Time122§ SugarBay122§ô NoUseDenying122ó Chased,no threat 9
18Þ10= 8WO fm 1 ê :24§ :48¦ 1:12 1:35¨ 3ÎçOC 80k/N3X -N 78 7 5¨ô 6¨ô 5§ 5¨ö 4« Jones J L122 2.75 76= 18 Magic Broomstick122¦ Sugar Bay122¨ Avie'sTale122§ Lacked strong rally 8
16Ü10= 4WO fm 1 ê :23© :47§ 1:10©1:34 3ÎçAlw 78068NC 89 2 4¦ô 4§ 3¦ 1ô 2§ Jones J L121 8.15 88= 10 Simply Splendid123§ Missit121ö Much Obliged121ó Just off fin well ins 7
30ß10= 5CD fm 1 ê :24¨ :48¨ 1:12§1:36 3ÎçOC 80k/N3X -N 74 3 7©õ 7©õ 9ªõ 8ªö 7«ö Smith M E L121 3.30 86= 08 Danzon121¦õ Coulee121§ôîForest Trail121 Steadied 1/8 pl 11
Previously trained by Cecil B D A 2009(as of 9/9): ( 101 13 17 9 0.13 )
9æ09= 8Dmr fm 1Â ê :24§ :48© 1:12 1:40¨ 3ÎçPalomarH-G2 70 7 4§ 4§ 7« 8¦¦ 8¦¦ö Smith M E LB116 15.90 83= 04 GottHveHer119É LethlHet117ö CrribenSunset120ö Stalked,3wd,weakened 8
2Ý09= 3Dmr fm 1 ê :23 :46© 1:09©1:33¨ 3ÎçOC 62k/N2X -N 92 2 4¨ô 4© 3§ 1Ç 1Ç Smith M E LB120 2.20 94= 07 Missit120Ç Hot n' Dusty122¨ö Taste's Sis113Ç Led,inched away,held 5
11Û09= 7Hol fm 1Â ê :24 :47 1:10§1:40§ 4ÎçAlw 69176N2X 89 5 7«ô 6« 5ª 5§õ 2É Rosario J LB119 7.40 93= 07 Allicansayis Wow121ÉMissit119Ç Hot n'Dusty123¦ô 4wd into str,late 2nd 7
24Ü09= 3GG fm 1 ê :24 :48¦ 1:12©1:37© 3ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 83 6 3¨ 2¦ 2¦ 2ô 2¦ô Bisono A LB123 b 2.20 80= 19 SummersPeace118¦ô Missit123ÉWineandDyne123ô Stlkd 3-2w, bid, hung 6
15ß09= 7SA fm 1° ê :47¨1:11¦ 1:34¨1:46© 4ÎçAlw 58208N2X 66 2 4¨ 4§ô 4§ 7¬ 7¦¥ Smith M E LB119 b *1.60 84= 04 CtbythTl119ÉMdnPrncss119É GnrlCnsnss119§õ 3wd 2nd turn,weakened 8
16Ý08= 8Dmr fm 1° ê :47 1:11¦ 1:35 1:46¨ çDMrOaks-G1 82 9 8¬ô 8¬ö 9¨ö 8ªô 6©ô Flores D R LB122 b 17.00 85= 09 MagicalFantasy122§ BelAirSizzle122ô LethalHeat122É Tight 3/8,4wd lane 10
WORKS: å6WO ú5f fst 1:00© B 9/66 æ22WO ú4f fst :49¨ B 21/51 æ15WO ú4f fst :49 H 11/33 æ8WO tr.tê5f fm 1:01¦ B(d) 7/11 Ý1WO tr.tê5f fm 1:00¨ B 6/29 Û24WO ú5f fst 1:02¦ B 30/86
TRAINER: WonLastStart(93 .29 $3.09) Turf(219 .21 $2.43) Routes(333 .23 $2.37) GrdStk(88 .16 $2.06)

WayWith Words
Own: Schwartz George L
Black, Red Yoke, White Emblem, White

CHAVEZ J F (40 3 4 1 .08) 2010: (455 58 .13)

B. m. 6 (May)
Sire: Sefapiano (Fappiano)
Dam:Swiftly Tilting (Belong to Me)
Br: Margaret C Schwartz & George Schwartz (NJ)
Tr: Eppler Mary E(>) 2010:(81 10 .12)

L 120

Life 29 11 5 3 $565,400 95

2010 9 3 1 1 $183,910 95

2009 9 3 1 1 $177,140 92

Belê 0 0 0 0 $0 -

D.Fst 17 8 3 2 $417,940 94

Wet(370) 6 1 1 1 $69,410 92
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(328) 6 2 1 0 $78,050 95
Dstê(371) 3 1 0 0 $36,980 93

18æ10= 9Mth fst 1Â :24¨ :49§ 1:14 1:44¨ 3ÎçÐJerseyGrlH96k 84 4 4§ô 4¦ô 3¦ô 3ô 2Ç Castro E L123 *1.10 82= 22 EmilyAllstar118ÇWayWithWords123¨ö LilKiar118©õ Game finish outside 8
22Ý10=10Mth my 6f :22 :44© :57 1:09© 3ÎçTrenton109k 87 3 8 9§ö 6¨ 8«õ 5¨ô Castro E L123 5.70 84= 15 Love That Dance117¦ô All Giving123ô Lady Alexander123ô 3 wide into lane 9
11Û10=11Mth fst 1¬¥ :23 :46¨ 1:11¦1:42 3ÎçÐSpruceFirH94k 80 3 6§ö 6¨ 3§ô 3¨ô 3¨ô Castro E L126 *.90 79= 20 MonighLs116§ö LovThtDnc118ö WyWthWords126§ö Mild stretch response 7
27Þ10= 9Mth fst 6f :22¨ :45¦ :57§1:10¦ 3ÎçBluSparklr105k 89 1 6 5¨õ 3§ 3§ 1É Castro E L123 2.60 86= 19 WayWithWords123É Sarlight117ö RtedFiesty117ª 3wd,game response,up 6
13Þ10= 9Mth fst 6f :22¦ :45© :58 1:10§ 3ÎçÐOpenMindH97k 87 2 7 7§õ 3ô 2ô 1¨ Castro E L124 *1.00 85= 18 WayWith Words124¨ Dakota Doll117©õMoneigh Lisa115§ 3wd bid,drew out 9
15Ü10= 9Pim fm 1Â ê :24 :47§ 1:10©1:41 3ÎçGalrettH-G3 93 7 3¦ô 3§ô 3©ô 3¨ 6¨õ Borel C H L117 11.00 93= 07 Rainbow View121ô Quiet Meadow114Ç Ave116É 3-4wd turns, weakened 8
10ß10= 9GP fm 7ôf ê :22¦ :46§ 1:10§1:27§ 3ÎçSouthBeach50k 95 4 4 6¬ 6¨õ 1© 1©ö Lezcano J L122 11.50 99= 05 WayWith Words122©ö Akilina122É Sandi'sReady116¦ô 4 wide, drew away 7
20à10= 6GP fm 1 ê :23 :46¨ 1:10¦1:34 4ÎçOC 80k/N3X -N 85 1 5§ô 6§õ 5¦ô 8ªö 6ªõ Castro E L120 36.30 85= 14 Scolara120¦õ Cherokee Queen122ô Pull Dancer120¦ö Tired 10
13á10= 7GP fst 6ôf :22¨ :45§ 1:09©1:16¦ 4ÎçHcnBrti-G3 59 5 9 6©ö 7ªô 8¦¦ 8¦¬ö Castro E L120 25.30 73= 13 Kays and Jays118ô Tar Heel Mom118¦ôWarbling118« Off slowly 9
31å09= 9Aqu fst 1° :49 1:12© 1:37¦1:50¦ 3ÎçTnbkAlmH-G3 84 5 2¦ 2ô 2ô 3§ 3ªö Castro E L115 9.90 83= 12 UnbridledBll120© Wthrd115¦ö WyWithWords115§õ Prompted,lacked rally 8
10å09= 8Med fm 1Â ê :23¦ :47¦ 1:12¦1:41¨ 3ÎçViolet-G3 82 9 2¦ 2§ô 2¦ 4§ 4¦ô Hill C L121 10.00 91= 07 QuietHrbor117ö AlwysforLove121Ç AllIsVnity121ö Stalked, bid, weakened 10
20æ09= 9Mth fst 1Â :25¨ :50¦ 1:14¦1:45§ 3ÎçPolitely85k 86 6 2¦ô 2¦ 2Ç 1Ç 1¦ Castro E L122 *1.70 79= 26 WyWthWords122¦ AllNghtLbor122§ö HvnsHny118§ö Stalked, led, driving 6
WORKS: òå9Lrl 5f fst :59¨ H 1/27 òå2Lrl 5f fst 1:01§ B 1/23 æ8Lrlê5f fm 1:02¨ B(d) 1/2 òÝ14Lrl 5f gd :59© H 1/19 Û31Lrl 4f fst :48¦ B 8/68
TRAINER: Dirt/Turf(18 .22 $4.92) Turf(48 .17 $3.16) Routes(98 .14 $1.67) GrdStk(4 .00 $0.00)

Strike the Bell
Own: Rising Star Stables
Royal Blue, Silver Star, Silver Sleeves

SOLIS A (33 3 4 1 .09) 2010: (424 44 .10)

Ch. f. 4 (Apr) ESMAY 08 $45,000
Sire: Mizzen Mast (Cozzene) $15,000
Dam:Vesper Cat (Mountain Cat)
Br: Mr & Mrs Theodore Kuster & Mr & Mrs Howard Rob (Ky)
Tr: Donk David(18 3 2 3 .17) 2010:(151 17 .11)

L 123

Life 16 4 4 3 $237,278 94

2010 5 2 1 0 $126,567 94

2009 8 2 2 2 $96,437 93

Belê 7 2 2 1 $119,721 93

D.Fst 3 0 1 1 $14,490 70

Wet(372) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Synth 1 0 0 0 $667 68
Turf(311) 12 4 3 2 $222,121 94
Dstê(365) 6 1 2 1 $85,667 94

19æ10= 9Bel gd 1 ê :23§ :46 1:09©1:34§ 3ÎçNblDmsl-G3 92 1 8®õ 7¦§ 6¬ô 3§ 1¦õ Dominguez R A L118 4.40 89= 12 StriketheBell118¦õ QuietMeadow116¦ Scolara118ô 4w 1/4,with confidence 8
28Ý10= 8Sar fm 1Â Ñ :23§ :47§ 1:11 1:40§ 3ÎçBlstSpaH-G2 92 5 8¦¥ 8¦¨ 9¦¥ 5©ô 6¨õ Prado E S L118 27.25 95= 10 Dynaslew118ô Silver Reunion118¦Miss Keller118¦ Inside turns,no kick 10
4Û10=10Mth fm 1Â ê :24¨ :48¦ 1:12 1:41§Õ3ÎçMsLiberty97k 94 3 6©ô 6«õ 4¦ô 3¦ô 2Ç Velazquez J R L119 2.50 87= 14 Maram117Ç Strike the Bell119ô Eye of Taurus117ô Bid 4 wide, gamely 9
30Ü10=11Mth fm 1Â ê :23© :46© 1:10 1:39¨Õ3ÎçAlw 79800N2X 94 2 5§ 5©ô 6¨ö 2ô 1¦ Velazquez J R L120 4.10 96= 07 StrikthBll120¦ QunMrth120© UnbridldEssnc120É Hand urged,proved best 8
1Ü10= 8Bel fm 1Â Ñ :25© :50© 1:14¦1:42¦ 3ÎçBeaugay-G3 73 5 5¨ 5¨ô 5§õ 4ª 7¦¥õ Luzzi M J L115 14.20 77= 10 Dynaslew117¨õ Scolara115§ Chestoria117¦ No factor 8
24å09= 9Kee fst 7f ú :22 :44© 1:09§1:22¨ çRavenRun-G2 68 13 13 14®õ 14¤õ 9«ö 9¦¥ô Theriot H J II L118 12.40 80= 11 SatansQuickChick117ô SlidesChoice119ô Donttalktome117¦ö 8 wide 1/4 pl 14
20æ09= 8Bel fm 7f ê :23© :47© 1:10¨1:21¨ çChaldea69k 87 1 6 6ªô 6© 3¦ 2ô Dominguez R A L118 *1.15 91= 08 Legally Blanca118ô Strike the Bell118¦ö Haka118Ç Swung 5wide rallied 6
2æ09= 1Sar fm 5ôf ê :21§ :44¨ :56 1:02 3ÎçAlw 52000N1X 90 5 9 9« 9¨ö 1ô 1¨õ Dominguez R A L116 3.35 93= 05 StrikethBll116¨õ LostWithoutYou120ö DwnChorus119É Drew off in hand 9
2Ý09= 1Sar gd 1 Ñ :24© :48 1:12¨1:37 3ÎçAlw 53000N1X 86 7 7¬ô 7¤ 7ªô 4¨ 3¦õ Velasquez C L118 2.85 84= 24 Miss Catalyst119É Dynaslew119¦ Strike theBell118¦ Swung 4wide, belatedly 8
26Þ09= 8Bel yl 1Â Ñ :26© :52 1:16 1:47§ çPerfectSti69k 88 5 7«ô 8¬ö 6© 1§ 2ô Velasquez C L118 8.70 66= 36 DmeEllen118ô StrikthBll118§õ ShrdAccount118Ç Bold 4w sweep, gamely 8
17Ü09= 5Bel fm 7f ê :23¦ :47© 1:11§1:23¦ 3ÎçMd SpWt 43k 93 7 7 7« 6¨ô 2Ç 1ö Velasquez C L118 9.10 84= 15 Strike the Bell118ö Minishaft118¨ West Court118§ Swung 7wide 10
1à09= 9Aqu fst 6f Ö :23§ :47¨ :59©1:12§ 3ÎçMd SpWt 43k 60 5 9 10«ô 9«ô 8¤ô 5©õ Lopez C C L116 5.20 78= 18 Lisa B123¦ô Boca Belle116ö Bea Bet116§ Wide turn, drifted out 11
WORKS: å10Bel tr.t 4f fst :48© B 11/59 å3Bel tr.t 3f fst :38§ B 39/51 æ12Bel tr.t 4f fst :49 B 14/51 Ý21Sar 4f fst :50 B 35/55 Ý11Sar 4f fst :52 B 34/36 Ý3Sar 4f fst :52 B 25/26
TRAINER: WonLastStart(39 .08 $2.24) Turf(202 .12 $1.16) Routes(261 .11 $1.30) GrdStk(8 .12 $1.35)
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Entered For Main Track Only
McVictory
Own: WinStar Farm
White, Green And Black Emblem, Green

NO RIDER

Ch. f. 4 (Mar)
Sire: Victory Gallop (Cryptoclearance)
Dam:Emma's Dilemma (Capote)
Br: Sabine Stable (Ky)
Tr: Pletcher Todd A(46 9 8 5 .20) 2010:(876 230 .26)

L 118

Life 22 5 5 5 $228,253 90

2010 8 1 4 3 $102,700 89

2009 11 3 1 1 $94,973 90

Bel 3 1 0 2 $49,600 90

D.Fst 11 2 4 3 $134,725 89

Wet(362) 2 1 0 0 $28,980 90
Synth 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(283) 9 2 1 2 $64,548 83
Dst(349) 7 1 2 1 $70,605 90

26æ10= 9Bel fst 1Â :23¦ :46¦ 1:11 1:43 3ÎçNellieBly70k 78 5 4¦ô 2¦ 1Ç 3¨ô 3¤ Velazquez J R L119 *1.65 73= 24 OurKhrysty119©õ BnkrsBuy119¨ö McVictory119ªö Rated,bid 3/8,no match 6
20Ý10= 3Sar fst 7f :23¦ :46© 1:11 1:24 3ÎçOC 75k/N3X -N 86 1 2 3§ 3É 2¦ 2§ Dominguez R A L120 *.90 83= 14 MoontunMssy120§ McVctory120¦õ PrfctforYo120« 3w bid turn,outfinishd 5
5Û10= 9Bel fst 7f :22¦ :44© 1:09¦1:22§ 3ÎçBedORosH-G3 88 8 7 7« 4¨ô 3¨ 3¨õ Dominguez R A L115 7.70 88= 10 Rightly So116Ç Qualia115¨õ McVictory115¦õ Ang 3w 5/16,outkicked 8
30Ü10=10Mth fst 1¬¥ :24 :48¨ 1:13 1:42 3ÎçMthBeach96k 84 8 1ô 1ô 1ô 1ô 2¦ô Velazquez J R L118 5.60 81= 20 Just Jenda118¦ô McVictory118ó Ask the Moon118©õ Set pace, gamely 8
Previously trained by Barbara Robert 2010(as of 4/15): ( 67 6 16 7 0.09 )
15ß10= 3Aqu fst 1 :24¦ :47© 1:12©1:37§ 4ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 89 6 3¦ô 3¦ô 2¦ô 1© 1«õ Cohen D L120 f 3.25 81= 19 McVictory120«õ Persistntly120É Clssofsixtythr123©ö Rail move, drew off 6
25à10= 3Aqu fst 1 Ö :24¦ :48§ 1:13§1:38¨ 4ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 78 2 3§ô 4§ 3¦ 3§ 3¨ö Cohen D L120 f 4.10 82= 23 Ampart Ridge123¨ Zaphyra123öMcVictory120ö 3wide, evenly 5
21â10= 3Aqu fst 1¬¥ Ö :24¦ :49 1:13§1:42¦ 4ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 77 2 3§ô 3§ 3§ô 3¬ 2®ö Cohen D L118 f *1.15 81= 19 PamonaBall118®ö McVictory118ÉMissDrtmouth118¨ô Bid turn no match 6
8â10= 8Aqu fst 1 Ö :24¦ :48© 1:14©1:40¨ 4ÎçOC 50k/N2X -N 78 5 3¨ 4§ 5§ô 1ô 2¦ Cohen D L120 f 4.60 75= 22 Starship Angel123¦ McVictory120ª Judge Margaret121¨ Led, yielded late 8
18å09= 8Bel slyø 1Â ï :23¨ :47 1:11§1:42¦ 3ÎçAlw 46000N1X 90 2 7©ô 7© 4§ 2Ç 1©õ Bravo J L117 f 20.90 88= 12 McVictory117©õ PatienceDrive117§ StoneLegacy117¦ô Checked 1/4, alt crs 7
30æ09= 1Bel yl 7f ê :24 :47¨ 1:10¨1:22© 3ÎçAlw 45000N1X 75 5 5 6« 6©ô 7¤ô 7¬õ Velasquez C L117 f 26.00 79= 14 WhiskdAwy119¦õ GrntdTigr120ÇWildPoppy119¦ö Pinched break outrun 7
3æ09=10Sar fm 1Â Ñ :24§ :48¨ 1:12©1:42© 3ÎçClm 35000N3L 80 4 6© 6«ô 5¨ô 2¦ 1ô Velasquez C L118 f 9.20 86= 07 McVictory118ô Platinumplus120¦õ Kevazinga120¨ Steadied early, wide 9
19Ý09= 6Sar gd 1Â Ñ :24¦ :48§ 1:13¦1:43¦ 3ÎçAlw 53000N1X 64 3 8¤ô 8¦¦ 8¬ 9¤ 9¦¦õ Luzzi M J L116 f 20.80 73= 19 Miss World119ô Redreamit117¨õ Bum Bum116§ Steadied early no bid 10
WORKS: æ19Sar tr.t 4f fst :48© H 9/41 æ12Sar tr.t 4f fst :51 B 28/35 Ý14Sar 4f fst :48¨ B 6/41 Ý8Sar 4f fst :49¨ B 38/56 Û26Sar 5f fst 1:00§ B 16/78
TRAINER: Dirt(1210 .26 $1.78) Routes(1181 .22 $1.82) GrdStk(341 .19 $1.66)
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